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in accordance with paragraphs I to 4 above 
and the financial regulations. 

6. No resolution, decision or amendment 
involving expenditure, which has not already 
been considered in accordance with para- 
graphs 2 and 3, shall be approved by the 
Conference unless it is accompanied by an 
estimate of expenditures prepared by the Di- 
rector-General. No resolution, decision or 
amendment in respect of which expenditures 
are anticipated by the Director-General shall 
be approved by the Conference until the Pro- 
gramme and Budget Committee and subse- 
quently the Board, meeting concurrently with 
the Conference, have had an opportunity to 
act in accordance with paragraphs 2 and 3. 
The Board shall submit its decisions to the 
conference. The approval by the Conference 
of such resolutions, decisions and amend- 
ments shall require a two-thirds majority of 
all Members. 

Article 15 
Assessed contributions 

1. Regular budget expenditures shall be bor- 
ne by the Members, as apportioned in accor- 
dance with a scale of assessment established 
by the Conference by a two-thirds majority 
of the members present and voting, upon the 
recommendation of the Board adopted by a 
two-thirds majority of the members present 
and voting, on the basis of a draft prepared 
by the Programme and Budget Committee. 

2. The scale of assessments shall be based to 
the extent possible on the scale most recently 
employed by the United Nations. No Mem- 
ber shall be assessed more than twenty-five 
per cent of the regular budget of the Organi- 
zation. 

Article 16 
Voluntary contributions to the Organization 

Subject to the financial regulations of the 
Organization: The Director-General, on be- 
half of the Organization, may accept volun- 
tary contributions to the Organization, inclu- 
ding gifts, bequests and subventions, made to 
the Organization by governments, intergo- 
vernmental or non-governmental organizati- 
ons or other non-governmental sources, pro- 

vided that the conditions attached to such 
voluntary contributions are consistent with 
the objective and policies of the Organizati- 
on. 

Article 17 
Industrial Development Fund 

In order to increase the resources of the 
Organization and to enhance its ability to 
meet promptly and flexibly the needs of the 
developing countries, the Organization shall 
have an Industrial Development Fund which 
will be financed through the voluntary con- 
tributions to the Organization provided for 
in Article 16, and other income as may be 
provided for in the financial regulations of 
the Organization. The Director-General shall 
administer the Industrial Development Fund 
in accordance with the general policy guide- 
lines governing the operations of the Fund 
that are established by the Conference, or by 
the Board acting on behalf of the Conferen- 
ce, and in accordance with the financial re- 
gulations of the Organization. 

CHAPTER V 

Co-operation and Co-ordination 
Article 18 

Relations with the United Nations 

The Organization shall be brought into 
relationship with the United Nations as one 
of the specialized agencies. referred to in Ar- 
ticle 57 of the Charter of the United Nations. 
Any agreement concluded in accordance 
with Article 63 of the Charter shall require 
the approval of the Conference, by a two- 
thirds majority of the Members present and 
voting, upon the recommendation of the Bo- 
ard. 

Article 19 
Relations with other organizations 

The Director-General may, with the ap- 
proval of the Board and subject to guidelines 
established by the Conference: 

(a) Enter into agreements establishing ap- 
propriate relationships with other organizati- 
ons of the United Nations system and with 
other intergovernmental and governmental 
organizations, 


